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CBS 2’s MEGAN GLAROS ‘SHARES THE LOVE’ AT  
CANCER RESOURCE CENTRE FUND RAISER 

 
 
MUNSTER – CBS 2 Meteorologist Megan Glaros returns home to Northwest Indiana to 
“Share the Love” as the guest speaker for the 9th annual Share the Love event, Wed, Feb. 10 
at the Center for Visual & Performing Arts in Munster. A busy broadcasting professional and 
mother of three, Glaros will share her insight on effective time management.  
 
Sponsored by the Friends of the Cancer Resource Centre in conjunction with the auxiliaries of 
Community Hospital, St. Catherine Hospital and St. Mary Medical Center, the luncheon 
program highlights Dyer native Glaros’ career.  
 
After graduating with a double major in journalism and atmospheric sciences from Indiana 
University, Glaros worked for the Sinclair Broadcast Group in Baltimore. Her career as an on 
air meteorologist began at WTAP-TV in West Virginia. She subsequently worked at WPLG-
TV in Miami, Florida and at WCBS-TV in New York. Glaros currently forecasts the weather 
during the CBS 2 Morning News at 4:30, 5 and 6 a.m. broadcasts. 
 
 Net proceeds from the luncheon will benefit the Cancer Resource Centre in Munster. The 
Resource Centre is a program of the Community Cancer Research Foundation, a not-for-profit 
organization dedicated to improving the quality of cancer care in northwest Indiana and the 
south Chicago suburbs. All services of the Cancer Resource Centre – support groups, mind-
body-spirit classes, educational offerings and a resource library - are offered free of charge to 
those in need. 
 
 
      (more) 

 



Share the Love 2016 
Page 2 

 
Beginning at 10:30 a.m. until 2 p.m., vendor tables will offer boutique items for sale with a 
portion of those proceeds also benefiting the Cancer Resource Centre. Each reservation is $50 
per person. Space is limited. Reservations must be made no later than Feb. 5, 2016. 
 
Luncheon will be served at 12 p.m. Menu items will be prepared by Center for Visual & 
Performing Arts Executive Chef Joseph Trama. The Center for Visual & Performing Arts is 
located at 1040 Ridge Road in Munster. 
 
Please make checks payable to Community Cancer Research Foundation, and mail to: 
Community Foundation of NW Indiana, Attention: Sherri Holt, 905 Ridge Road, Munster, IN 
46321. For additional information, please contact Sherri Holt at 219-836-0130 or 
sholt@comhs.org. 
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